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This paper presents some nice data on numerous VOCs in a single, small biomass
burning plume in Georgia. While the data appear to be high quality, I have a signif-
icant problem with the authors’ analysis, especially treatment of dilution. To me, the
treatment of dilution invalidates some of their primary conclusions. While I believe the
authors could eventually generate an acceptable manuscript, it will require a substan-
tially reworked analysis. For this reason, I suggest that this paper be rejected and the
authors be encouraged to resubmit after the analysis is corrected. Details below.

31508, line 17: Unclear why you can not use linear regression. Line 23: I don’t see 4
points. You have averaged the two values inside the plume and a value outside of the
plume. This is two points. Line 25: Above you say you can not use linear regression,
but now you say you can??? 31509, line 10, equation: This equation is incorrect in
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that it treats all tracers the same regardless of background mixing ratios. This is a sig-
nificant error. The apparent dilution ratio will be very different for compounds with sig
background concentrations (like CO and O3) then for reactive VOCs, which for have
nearly zero backgrounds. . ..In addition I am really guessing on the interpretation of this
equation, since none of the terms are defined. This is a significant error, but it is not
possible to gauge the magnitude of the error since the authors have omitted primary
data (eg the CO dilution) that would allow us to estimate the size of dilution terms. Its
important to note that this error makes it impossible to interpret the results on produc-
tion and loss of many species. Line 20: It would be better to use MW, not Mx. Line
25: 2% seems very odd, since there are many hundreds of VOCs, many unidentified.
31510, line 10: The box model is not well described with respect to dilution. I am un-
clear what is meant by “CO was used as a dilution tracer”. Did you include background
concentrations and use a dilution factor which allowed you to match the CO obs? This
would be a reasonable approach. If so, you need to list the background concentra-
tions used for each species. 31514, line 1 and Figure 6. I really cant interpret “dilution
corrected” due to the error mentioned above. It is impossible to interpret Figures 6-9
without knowing more about the impacts of dilution on these mixing ratios. So as indi-
cated above, I suggest this ms be rejected and the authors to resubmit after fixing this
significant error.
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